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Project Name: Collinsville High School Ahtletic Track Improvements Witness:
Project No.: 11-1297.01

Date: September 8, 2011, 2:00 p.m.
Contractor ATG Sports Byrne & Jones GRS Hellas ICS JJ Wuellner L Wolf Tindall Unterbrink
Bid Bond v v v v v v v v v
Addendum #] v v v v v v v v v
Addendum #2 v v v v v v v v v
Base Bid $494,555 $52%.000 $896.000 $702.885 $700,000 $604,660 $681,000 $487.517 $551,000
T.1 N/A $412,000 5403,950 N/A 5407,83 5417,440 5408,000 N/A N/A
lallsd N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A No Bid N/A N/A N/A -
T2 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A No Bid N/A N/A N/A
T.1.3 N/A 524,000 $23,175 N/A 523,625 523,850 523,600 N/A N/A
1.1.4 N/A 522,500 $21,075 N/A 521,420 $21,625 521,500 N/A N/A
BB, T.1,3.4 $987,500 $1,344,200 $1.152,881 $1.067.575 $1.134,100
1.2 N/A $365.000 $358,311 N/A $361,757 $370,320 $361,000 $368,600 3368.647
T2.] N/A $355.000 $348,448 N/A $351,799 $360,125 ($9.500) $358.500 $358,500
1.2.2 N/A $330.000 $323.385 N/A $326,495 $334,220 [$33.500] $332.714 $332.714
1.2.3 N/A $12,900 512,186 N/A 512,304 512,425 $12,300 512,538 $12,538
1.2.4 N/A $19.000 517,948 N/A $18.121 518,295 : 518,200 518,466 $18.466
BB, T1.2,34 $925,900 $1,284,445 $1.092,182 $1.005,700 $1.072,500 $1,087,121 $250,651
7.3 N/A $507.000 5498,577 N/A 5428,929 ' $515,260 $503.000 $512,960 5479.401
T.3.1 N/A $485.000 $481,627 N/A ($22.105) $497.065 ($16.000) $494,822 $494,822
1.3.2 N/A $460.000 $453,292 N/A ($34.989) $466.610 ($45.285) $464,504 $464.504
1.3.3 N/A $19.000 518,031 N/A $16.826 $18.380 $18.200 318,551 518,551
T.3.4 N/A $21,000 521,367 N/A 517,451 520,400 $20,200 520,592 $20,592
BB, T1.3,3.4 $1,076,000 $1,433,975 $702,885 $1,163,206 $1,158,700 $1,222,400 $1,239,620 $1,069,544




T.4 $5386,939 N/A N/A N/A N/A No Bid N/A N/A
T.4.1 $385.700 N/A N/A N/A N/A No Bid N/A N/A
T.4.2 | $377.461 N/A N/A N/A N/A No Bid N/A N/A
T.4.3 522,400 N/A N/A N/A N/A No Bid N/A N/A
T.4.4 $11,700 N/A N/A N/A N/A No Bid N/A N/A
BB, T.434 $915,594
Fencing
F.1 $106.881 $122,000 $141,000 $147,300 $133.000 $118,960 $104.500 $105,382 $120.292
Sidewalk .
S.1 $77.986 $88,000 $76.000 $120.860 $87.000 $84.825 $54.,400 $77.3%0 $66,286
North Bleacher
B.1 $128,700 $159.000 $144,000 $184,085 $151,750 $144,960 $141,000 $146,918 $147,431
South Bleacher
B.2 $138.100 $169,000 $160.000 $202,830 $167.000 $161.790 $157.100 $162,322 $159.888
Combined
Bleacher Bid
B.3 $248,300 $308,000 $281.000 $362,000 $298,000 $285.700 $275,800 $266,181 $307.319
Comments: Voluntary Turf Bid
TOTAL BASE BID
AND
ALTERNATES 51,348,761 $1,505,500 $1,842,200 $1,766,073 $1,670.881 $1,557,060 51,568,800 51,536,074 $1,444,548
T.1.2 Field Turf w/all ambient rubber infill T.4.2 ATG Turf w/all ambient rubber infill 3
T.1.3 Field Turf center of field mascot logo T.4.3 ATG Turf center of field mascot logo
T.1.4 Field Turf endzone team lettering T.4.4 ATGTurf endzone team lettering
1.2 Shaw Turf w/silica sand and cryo rubber infill
T.2:1 Shaw Turf w/silica sand and ambient rubber infill F.1 Fencing
T.2.2 Shaw Turf w/all ambient rubber infill 81 Sidewalk - North end sidewalk, drainage, fencing and
T.2.3 Shaw Turf center of field mascot logo related work.
T.2.4 Shaw Turf endzone feam lettering B.1 Bleachers - North end
B.2 Bleachers - South end
1.3 Asiro Turf w/silica sand and cryo rubber infill B.3 Combined bleacher bid (alternate No. B1 and B2).
1.3.1 Astro Turf w/silica sand and ambient rubber infill
1.3.2 Astro Turf w/all ambient rubber infill
1.3.3 Astro Turf center of field mascot logo
1.3.4 Astro Turf endzone team leftering




